

### City of Antioch Bid Tabulation

**Janitorial Supplies, Bid No. 485-0123-08F, Closed February 15, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.**

Item Qty	Unit	Description	Hammons Supply Co. Concord, CA	J. C. Nelson Fairfield, CA	Ernest Packaging Sol Sacramento, CA	Cole Supply Hayward, CA	Office Max Express Newark, CA	Linwood Supply Inc Dixon, Ca	Universal Bldg Serv. Richmond, CA	Waxie Sanitary Livermore, CA	Pyramid School Prod. Tampa, FL
1.	400 CS	C-fold paper towels, white	\$18.25	\$19.45	\$19.43	\$22.87 SC151	\$21.34	\$24.48	\$23.07	\$20.50	No Bid
									GP# 25190	G.P. #21994	
2.	100 CS	Toilet paper rolls	\$34.35	\$37.07	\$37.93	\$42.95	\$38.97	\$47.88	\$43.00	\$38.22	No Bid
									G.P. #19880	#851166	
3.	10 CS	Toilet paper interfolded	NO BID	\$69.35	\$70.98	\$69.90	\$69.63	\$83.90	\$80.52	\$72.65	No Bid
										#851340	
4.	30 CS	Toilet seat covers, ½ fold	\$23.00	\$23.10	\$27.30	\$24.95	\$87.18	\$36.88	\$25.14	\$27.72	\$29.98
				250/pkg					Rochester Mid.	#851530	#DS5000 250/pkg
5.	30 CS	Toilet seat covers, ¼ fold	NO BID	\$31.25	\$44.43	\$27.95	\$41.34	\$64.64	\$40.73	\$40.11	\$98.95
									Rochester Mid.	#851710	#GNQTR-5m
6.	36 CS	Bleach, one-gallon jugs	\$10.87	\$10.70	\$9.22	\$10.50	\$22.27	No Bid	\$12.64	\$38.79	No Bid
						HAP6				#090101	
7.	40 CS	Germicidal cleaner, deod. 1-gal. jug, 6/cs	\$36.96	\$26.45	\$19.54	\$30.95	\$260.44	\$26.40	\$28.84	\$34.35	No Bid
						4 per case			Mission Labs	#170284 4/cs	
8.	30 CS	Malodor counteract.	\$22.72	\$27.17	\$23.80	\$33.95	\$116.81	\$31.42	\$43.20	\$41.87	No Bid
										#162071	
9.	50 SK	Ultrasorb oil absorbent	No Bid	\$5.60	\$4.31	\$5.50	\$6.01	\$4.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
										#910020	
10.	300 CS	Trash bags, plastic	\$18.75	\$22.13	\$18.62	\$20.95	\$18.40	\$23.48	\$23.00	\$24.71	No Bid
										#703079	
11.	80 CS	Trash bags, orange	\$24.59	\$29.45	\$24.00	\$19.95	\$18.40	\$32.68	\$31.46	No Bid	No Bid
12.	40 CS	Liquid hand soap, pink frost	\$16.69	\$15.70	\$12.65	\$15.00	\$31.19	\$17.09	\$25.90	\$19.68	\$27.98
										#380254	
13.	200 CS	Multi-fold paper towels	\$18.50	\$19.55	\$19.54	\$21.00	\$22.43	\$24.64	\$23.50	\$20.89	No Bid
						#KC1807			G.P. 24590	#850232	
14.	200 CS	Light duty wipers	\$40.26	\$76.10	\$22.76	\$44.95	\$59.90	\$30.74	\$47.50	\$43.20	\$120.98
										G.P. #29215	
15.	144 CN	Bee, wasp, hornet killer, 4 oz. aerosol	\$4.54	\$3.90	\$2.78	\$3.99	\$3.99	\$3.50	\$5.94	\$4.87	\$3.26
										470051	Spray-Pak #4108
16.	144 CN	Insect killer	\$3.79	\$3.15	\$2.62	\$5.99	\$35.26	\$3.75	\$7.65	\$3.91	\$3.09
						C271				470090	Spray-Pak #4106
17.	10 CS	Glass cleaner, aerosol, 19 oz. can	\$23.18	\$23.40	\$18.36	\$2.15	\$37.57	\$29.00	\$32.44	\$24.35	\$27.15
				Chase 5155		Claire C050				#950152	Spray-Pak #4101
18.	30 CS	High gloss protect., aerosol, 14 oz. can	\$43.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
						6 btl/28 oz cs					
19.	30 CS	Vandalism remover, gelled formula	\$49.70	\$39.00	\$37.44	\$43.56	\$69.62	\$54.46	\$56.33	No Bid	\$39.98
				Chase 433-4105		Claire C880			Dymon		Spray-Pak #4105
			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30

Terms:

# City of Antioch Bid Tabulation

**Janitorial Supplies, Bid No. 485-0123-08F, Closed February 15, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.**

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Interboro Montgomery, NY	All American Piscataway, NJ	P&R Hayward, Ca	Sungro Los Angeles, Ca	e*Poly Star San Leandro, CA	Central Linden, NJ	Poly Corp. Poly Corp.	JC Paper Co Fremont, Ca	Unipak Corp. Brooklyn, NY	Daglow Hayward, Ca
1.	400	CS	C-fold paper towels, white	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.44	\$32.89	No Bid	\$19.66	\$21.35	No Bid	\$21.11	
2.	100	CS	Toilet paper rolls	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.11	\$56.38	\$37.20	\$59.66	\$39.81	No Bid	\$39.50	
3.	10	CS	Toilet paper interfolded	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00	\$49.22	No Bid	\$76.78	\$71.46	No Bid	No Bid	
4.	30	CS	Toilet seat covers, ½ fold	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.98	\$35.22	No Bid	No Bid	22.56	No Bid	\$28.24	
5.	30	CS	Toilet seat covers, ¼ fold	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.06	\$62.80	No Bid	No Bid	26.62	No Bid	\$27.99	
6.	36	CS	Bleach, one-gallon jugs	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.34	\$38.81	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.05	No Bid	\$11.90	
7.	40	CS	Germicidal cleaner, deod. 1-gal. jug, 6/cs	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.95	\$32.22	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.27	No Bid	\$43.33	
8.	30	CS	Malodor counteractant	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.88	\$37.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$29.59	No Bid	\$37.55	
9.	50	SK	Ultrasonic oil absorbent	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.75	\$45.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
10.	300	CS	Trash bags, plastic	*See Note.	\$17.91	\$21.36	\$72.00	\$18.72	\$19.70	19.72	\$21.90	\$20.10	
11.	80	CS	Trash bags, orange	*See Note.	\$20.43	\$26.53	\$33.40	\$29.90	\$29.80	\$25.72	\$37.00	No Bid	
12.	40	CS	Liquid hand soap, pink frost	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.64	\$28.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.93	No Bid	\$16.33	
13.	200	CS	Multi-fold paper towels	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.47	\$31.34	\$16.85	\$21.60	\$21.75	No Bid	\$18.50	
14.	200	CS	Light duty wipers	No Bid	No Bid	\$40.86	\$82.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$43.98	No Bid	No Bid	
15.	144	CN	Bee, wasp, hornet killer, 4 oz. aerosol	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.51	\$4.71	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.30	No Bid	\$5.84	
16.	144	CN	Insect killer	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.64	\$6.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.19	No Bid	No Bid	
17.	10	CS	Glass cleaner, aerosol, 19 oz. can	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.25	\$25.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.86	No Bid	No Bid	
18.	30	CS	High gloss protect., aerosol, 14 oz. can	No Bid	No Bid	\$51.32	\$38.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
19.	30	CS	Vandalism remover, gelled formula	No Bid	No Bid	\$37.85	\$48.05	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.18	No Bid	No Bid	
				Net 30	1% 10, Net 30	Net 30	1% Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	1%15/Net30	