
QTY Model Size Part Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

2 AMES 3000SS 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 386.00$     772.00$               172.75$     345.50$               341.53$     683.06$               

10 AMES 2000B 3/4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 17.00$       170.00$               13.85$       138.50$               13.69$       136.90$               

2 AMES 3000SS 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 362.00$     724.00$               162.25$     324.50$               320.74$     641.48$               

1 AMES 3000SS 10" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 115.00$     115.00$               498.50$     498.50$               111.98$     111.98$               

5 APOLLO 40-100 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       55.50$                 21.50$       107.50$               10.78$       53.90$                 

5 APOLLO 40-100 3/4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       55.50$                 21.50$       107.50$               10.78$       53.90$                 

5 APOLLO DCLF4A 1.5" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 22.50$       112.50$               11.50$       57.50$                 22.67$       113.35$               

2 APOLLO DC40 .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       22.20$                 10.90$       21.80$                 10.78$       21.56$                 

2 APOLLO DC40 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 22.50$       45.00$                 22.05$       44.10$                 21.80$       43.60$                 

10 APOLLO DC40 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       111.00$               10.90$       109.00$               10.78$       107.80$               

10 CONBRACO 4010 .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       111.00$               10.90$       109.00$               10.78$       107.80$               

10 CONBRACO 4010 1 COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       111.00$               10.90$       109.00$               10.78$       107.80$               

5 CONBRACO 4020 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       55.50$                 38.05$       190.25$               10.78$       53.90$                 

5 CONBRACO 4020 1"  RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT n/a -$                     107.35$     536.75$               n/a -$                     

5 CONBRACO 40-104-TC2 .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       55.50$                 10.90$       54.50$                 10.78$       53.90$                 

10 CONBRACO 40-100-02 .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 11.10$       111.00$               10.90$       109.00$               10.78$       107.80$               

5 CONBRACO 40-100 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 22.50$       112.50$               22.05$       110.25$               21.80$       109.00$               

20 FEBCO 825YAR .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 12.50$       250.00$               11.20$       224.00$               11.05$       221.00$               

20 FEBCO 825YAR .75" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 21.90$       438.00$               34.25$       685.00$               19.41$       388.20$               

20 FEBCO 825YAR 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 20.00$       400.00$               19.65$       393.00$               17.71$       354.20$               

20 FEBCO 825YAR 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 38.20$       764.00$               34.25$       685.00$               33.86$       677.20$               

30 FEBCO 825YA .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 12.50$       375.00$               11.15$       334.50$               11.05$       331.50$               

30 FEBCO 825YA .75" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 21.90$       657.00$               19.65$       589.50$               19.41$       582.30$               

20 FEBCO 825YA 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 20.00$       400.00$               17.90$       358.00$               17.71$       354.20$               

20 FEBCO 825YA 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 38.20$       764.00$               34.25$       685.00$               33.86$       677.20$               

5 FEBCO 825YD 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 116.00$     580.00$               52.00$       260.00$               102.86$     514.30$               

5 FEBCO 825YD 4" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 113.00$     565.00$               101.50$     507.50$               100.30$     501.50$               

5 FEBCO 825YD 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 166.00$     830.00$               74.25$       371.25$               146.77$     733.85$               

5 FEBCO 825YD 6" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 113.00$     565.00$               101.50$     507.50$               100.30$     501.50$               

5 FEBCO 825YD 6" COMPLETE RELIEF VALVE ASSEMBLY 1,030.00$  5,150.00$            925.40$     4,627.00$            914.63$     4,573.15$            

5 FEBCO 825YD 3" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 76.50$       382.50$               34.25$       171.25$               67.72$       338.60$               

5 FEBCO 825YD 3" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 113.00$     565.00$               101.50$     507.50$               100.30$     501.50$               

10 FEBCO 825YD 3" UPPER BUSHINGS 31.40$       314.00$               41.55$       415.50$               41.08$       410.80$               

2 FEBCO 825YD 4"-10" CHECK STEM 1,501.00$  3,002.00$            397.60$     795.20$               392.97$     785.94$               

2 FEBCO 825 1" CHECK STEM 27.30$       54.60$                 30.80$       61.60$                 30.47$       60.94$                 

20 FEBCO 825 1" RELIEF GUIDE 54.00$       1,080.00$            71.50$       1,430.00$            70.66$       1,413.20$            

10 FEBCO 880 3" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 133.00$     1,330.00$            119.25$     1,192.50$            117.87$     1,178.70$            

10 FEBCO 880 3" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 65.00$       650.00$               58.20$       582.00$               57.52$       575.20$               

5 FEBCO 860 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 14.40$       72.00$                 12.90$       64.50$                 12.76$       63.80$                 

5 FEBCO 860 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 22.90$       114.50$               20.50$       102.50$               20.26$       101.30$               

10 FEBCO 860 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 186.00$     1,860.00$            166.25$     1,662.50$            164.34$     1,643.40$            

2 FEBCO 860 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 215.00$     430.00$               192.35$     384.70$               190.13$     380.26$               

10 FEBCO 805 .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 12.50$       125.00$               11.15$       111.50$               11.05$       110.50$               

5 FEBCO 805 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 20.00$       100.00$               17.90$       89.50$                 17.71$       88.55$                 

2 FEBCO 805 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 116.00$     232.00$               52.00$       104.00$               51.43$       102.86$               

2 FEBCO 805 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 166.00$     332.00$               74.25$       148.50$               73.38$       146.76$               

5 FEBCO 880 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 217.00$     1,085.00$            no bid -$                     192.10$     960.50$               

5 FEBCO 880 6" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 65.00$       325.00$               194.35$     971.75$               57.52$       287.60$               
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3 FEBCO 880 3" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 133.00$     399.00$               119.25$     357.75$               117.87$     353.61$               

3 FEBCO 880 3" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 65.00$       195.00$               58.20$       174.60$               57.52$       172.56$               

2 FEBCO 880 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 169.00$     338.00$               151.05$     302.10$               149.33$     298.66$               

2 FEBCO 880 4" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 65.00$       130.00$               58.20$       116.40$               57.52$       115.04$               

2 FEBCO 806YD 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 166.00$     332.00$               74.30$       148.60$               146.77$     293.54$               

15 FEBCO 805YB .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 12.50$       187.50$               11.15$       167.25$               11.05$       165.75$               

10 FEBCO 825Y 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 116.00$     1,160.00$            52.00$       520.00$               102.86$     1,028.60$            

10 FEBCO 825Y 4" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 113.00$     1,130.00$            101.50$     1,015.00$            100.30$     1,003.00$            

20 WATTS 007 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 15.50$       310.00$               14.35$       287.00$               14.16$       283.20$               

3 WATTS 009M2QT 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 16.40$       49.20$                 6.75$         20.25$                 6.66$         19.98$                 

2 WATTS 909 8" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 165.00$     330.00$               187.75$     375.50$               183.60$     367.20$               

5 WATTS 909 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 14.90$       74.50$                 13.35$       66.75$                 13.17$       65.85$                 

5 WATTS 909 1" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 36.50$       182.50$               32.65$       163.25$               32.30$       161.50$               

5 WATTS 909 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 49.30$       246.50$               44.15$       220.75$               43.64$       218.20$               

5 WATTS 909 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 51.00$       255.00$               204.10$     1,020.50$            201.74$     1,008.70$            

5 WATTS 909 1" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 150.10$     750.50$               69.35$       346.75$               68.57$       342.85$               

5 WATTS 909 1" RELIEF VALVE COMPLETE 123.00$     615.00$               109.80$     549.00$               108.59$     542.95$               

5 WATTS 909 3" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 89.90$       449.50$               112.10$     560.50$               110.79$     553.95$               

5 WATTS 909 3" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 125.00$     625.00$               279.25$     1,396.25$            275.98$     1,379.90$            

2 WATTS 909 3" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 611.00$     1,222.00$            237.65$     475.30$               234.90$     469.80$               

20 WILKINS 950 1" COMPLETE RELIEF VALVE ASSEMBLY n/a -$                     n/a -$                     n/a -$                     

2 WILKINS 950 4" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 1,682.80$  3,365.60$            700.00$     1,400.00$            828.49$     1,656.98$            

3 WILKINS 950 6" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 3,027.60$  9,082.80$            1,125.00$  3,375.00$            1,584.30$  4,752.90$            

3 WILKINS 950 8" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 6,103.80$  18,311.40$           2,285.00$  6,855.00$            3,172.09$  9,516.27$            

3 WATTS 709 DCDA 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 136.00$     408.00$               41.55$       124.65$               41.08$       123.24$               

2 WATTS 009M2QT 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 33.00$       66.00$                 31.10$       62.20$                 30.74$       61.48$                 

2 WATTS 009M2QT 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 34.70$       69.40$                 14.35$       28.70$                 14.16$       28.32$                 

20 WATTS 007 3/4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 14.90$       298.00$               62.50$       1,250.00$            61.77$       1,235.40$            

3 WATTS 909RPDA 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 136.00$     408.00$               147.95$     443.85$               146.21$     438.63$               

3 WATTS 909RPDA 6" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 165.00$     495.00$               75.40$       226.20$               74.52$       223.56$               

2 WATTS 909RPDA 8" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 165.00$     330.00$               147.95$     295.90$               299.49$     598.98$               

10 WATTS 909RPDA 8" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 165.00$     1,650.00$            74.00$       740.00$               146.27$     1,462.70$            

10 WATTS 709 DCDA 8" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 165.00$     1,650.00$            122.15$     1,221.50$            148.76$     1,487.60$            

30 WILKINS 350XL 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 14.50$       435.00$               14.15$       424.50$               13.66$       409.80$               

30 WILKINS 350XL 1" COMPLETE CHECK HOUSING UNIT 78.40$       2,352.00$            76.85$       2,305.50$            17.19$       515.70$               

2 WILKINS 350 4" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 500.00$     1,000.00$            252.75$     505.50$               249.83$     499.66$               

5 WILKINS 350 6" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 657.00$     3,285.00$            350.00$     1,750.00$            325.06$     1,625.30$            

20 WILKINS 975 .75" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 16.50$       330.00$               26.50$       530.00$               23.02$       460.40$               

20 WILKINS 975 .75" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 13.20$       264.00$               26.50$       530.00$               9.88$         197.60$               

5 WILKINS 975 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 27.40$       137.00$               49.65$       248.25$               16.45$       82.25$                 

5 WILKINS 975XL 2" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 60.00$       300.00$               29.40$       147.00$               21.43$       107.15$               

2 WILKINS 975 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 159.00$     318.00$               205.45$     410.90$               108.44$     216.88$               

5 WILKINS 975XL 2" RELIEF VALVE RUBBER KIT 27.40$       137.00$               49.65$       248.25$               16.45$       82.25$                 

2 WILKINS 350DA 6" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 140.00$     280.00$               137.70$     275.40$               110.51$     221.02$               

2 WILKINS 950 3" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 55.70$       111.40$               54.65$       109.30$               54.01$       108.02$               

20 WILKINS 950XL 1" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 16.50$       330.00$               16.20$       324.00$               15.99$       319.80$               

10 WILKINS 950XL 2" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 23.00$       230.00$               21.40$       214.00$               22.33$       223.30$               

2 WILKINS 950DA 10" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 462.00$     924.00$               492.50$     985.00$               349.79$     699.58$               

5 WILKINS 375 4" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 78.00$       390.00$               76.50$       382.50$               61.42$       307.10$               
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5 WILKINS 375 4" CHECK ASSEMBLY COMPLETE 528.00$     2,640.00$            280.75$     1,403.75$            204.84$     1,024.20$            

5 WILKINS 375 3" COMPLETE CHECK RUBBER KIT 21.90$       109.50$               21.50$       107.50$               14.92$       74.60$                 

150 1/8" TEST COCKS 10.40$       1,560.00$            14.95$       2,242.50$            8.07$         1,210.50$            

150 1/4" TEST COCKS 12.30$       1,845.00$            14.95$       2,242.50$            8.07$         1,210.50$            

12 1/2" COPPER FITTING BRUSH 1.80$         21.60$                 1.50$         18.00$                 no bid -$                     

12 3/4" COPPER FITTING BRUSH 1.90$         22.80$                 2.60$         31.20$                 no bid -$                     

12 1" COPPER FITTING BRUSH 2.30$         27.60$                 2.95$         35.40$                 no bid -$                     

12 1 1/2" COPPER FITTING BRUSH 2.80$         33.60$                 3.35$         40.20$                 no bid -$                     

12 2" COPPER FITTING BRUSH 2.90$         34.80$                 3.85$         46.20$                 no bid -$                     

6 SNAP RING PLIERS 37.90$       227.40$               no bid -$                     no bid -$                     

200 TEST COCK CAPS 0.50$         100.00$               no bid -$                     0.52$         104.00$               

BACKFLOW PARTS SUBTOTAL 89,091.90$        61,859.25$        62,198.75$        

SUBTOTAL WITH NO-BID ITEMS REMOVED 87,539.10$        61,151.50$        61,134.25$        

 QTY Backflow Model Size

All backflow devices will be NRS gate valves 

unless otherwise specified Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

10 FEBCO 825YA .75" 381.00$     3,810.00$            302.50$     3,025.00$            324.09$     3,240.90$            

10 FEBCO 825YA 1" 385.00$     3,850.00$            309.50$     3,095.00$            331.44$     3,314.40$            

10 FEBCO 825YA 2" 801.00$     8,010.00$            641.85$     6,418.50$            687.45$     6,874.50$            

10 FEBCO 825Y .75" 296.00$     2,960.00$            240.70$     2,407.00$            257.79$     2,577.90$            

10 FEBCO 825Y 1" 314.00$     3,140.00$            254.50$     2,545.00$            272.54$     2,725.40$            

10 WATTS 909 .75" 600.00$     6,000.00$            486.90$     4,869.00$            521.49$     5,214.90$            

10 WATTS 909 1" 715.00$     7,150.00$            580.30$     5,803.00$            621.52$     6,215.20$            

5 WATTS 909 2" 1,330.00$  6,650.00$            1,078.85$  5,394.25$            1,242.50$  6,212.50$            

10 WATTS 950 (WILKINS 950) .75" 140.00$     1,400.00$            116.25$     1,162.50$            125.21$     1,252.10$            

10 WATTS 950 (WILKINS 950) 1" 155.00$     1,550.00$            128.25$     1,282.50$            138.10$     1,381.00$            

5 WATTS 950 (WILKINS 950) 2" 456.00$     2,280.00$            377.85$     1,889.25$            406.72$     2,033.60$            

5 WATTS 957 3" 1,400.00$  7,000.00$            1,096.40$  5,482.00$            1,174.32$  5,871.60$            

3 WATTS 957 4" 1,640.00$  4,920.00$            1,144.90$  3,434.70$            1,226.23$  3,678.69$            

2 WATTS 957 6" 2,820.00$  5,640.00$            2,400.20$  4,800.40$            2,570.70$  5,141.40$            

1 WATTS 957 8" 5,410.00$  5,410.00$            4,603.50$  4,603.50$            4,930.52$  4,930.52$            

1 WATTS 957 10" 6,930.00$  6,930.00$            5,719.95$  5,719.95$            6,126.25$  6,126.25$            

1 WATTS 757 DCDA 8" with OS&Y gate valves 3,550.00$  3,550.00$            4,079.25$  4,079.25$            4,369.01$  4,369.01$            

5 WILKINS 375AST 2" 502.00$     2,510.00$            515.00$     2,575.00$            496.83$     2,484.15$            

5 WILKINS 375AST 3" 1,530.00$  7,650.00$            1,390.00$  6,950.00$            1,394.21$  6,971.05$            

2 WILKINS 375AST 4" 1,790.00$  3,580.00$            1,627.00$  3,254.00$            1,700.22$  3,400.44$            

1 WILKINS 375AST 6" 3,070.00$  3,070.00$            2,796.00$  2,796.00$            2,751.69$  2,751.69$            

1 WILKINS 375AST 8" 5,900.00$  5,900.00$            5,085.00$  5,085.00$            5,172.90$  5,172.90$            

1 WILKINS 375AST 10" 7,550.00$  7,550.00$            6,511.00$  6,511.00$            6,624.04$  6,624.04$            

1 WILKINS 350ADR 8" 4,130.00$  4,130.00$            4,916.00$  4,916.00$            4,739.67$  4,739.67$            

1 WILKINS 350ADR 6" 2,520.00$  2,520.00$            2,696.00$  2,696.00$            2,598.91$  2,598.91$            

1 WILKINS 350ADR 10" 5,890.00$  5,890.00$            8,220.00$  8,220.00$            7,922.40$  7,922.40$            

5 WILKINS 975XL .75" 272.00$     1,360.00$            290.00$     1,450.00$            279.56$     1,397.80$            

5 WILKINS 975XL 2" 581.00$     2,905.00$            596.00$     2,980.00$            574.86$     2,874.30$            

10 WILKINS 350 1" 123.00$     1,230.00$            131.00$     1,310.00$            126.89$     1,268.90$            

5 WILKINS 350 .75" 112.00$     560.00$               119.00$     595.00$               115.41$     577.05$               

5 WILKINS 350 2" 379.00$     1,895.00$            389.00$     1,945.00$            374.86$     1,874.30$            

2 APOLLO 4ALF-100 LBF 3" 1,190.00$  2,380.00$            1,081.85$  2,163.70$            1,150.77$  2,301.54$            

2 APOLLO 4ALF-100 LBF 4" 1,390.00$  2,780.00$            1,277.40$  2,554.80$            1,391.96$  2,783.92$            
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1 APOLLO 4ALF-100 LBF 6" 2,190.00$  2,190.00$            1,986.40$  1,986.40$            2,156.84$  2,156.84$            

1 APOLLO 4ALF-100 LBF 8" 4,170.00$  4,170.00$            3,734.35$  3,734.35$            4,134.51$  4,134.51$            

2 APOLLO 4ANLF-100 LBF 3" 1,450.00$  2,900.00$            1,310.65$  2,621.30$            1,371.09$  2,742.18$            

2 APOLLO 4ANLF-100 LBF 4" 1,790.00$  3,580.00$            1,638.30$  3,276.60$            1,825.70$  3,651.40$            

1 APOLLO 4ANLF-100 LBF 6" 2,580.00$  2,580.00$            2,444.85$  2,444.85$            2,507.70$  2,507.70$            

1 APOLLO 4ANLF-100 LBF 8" 4,920.00$  4,920.00$            4,391.90$  4,391.90$            4,816.51$  4,816.51$            

BACKFLOW DEVICES SUBTOTAL 156,500.00$      140,467.70$      146,912.07$      

GRAND TOTAL 244,039.10$      201,619.20$      208,046.32$      
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